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In Memory of Jo Carolyn Flowers-Noe

Jo Carolyn Flowers-Noe forever put cancer behind her on February 8th, 2023. She beat
the disease for her final time at Barnes-Jewish Hospital in the comfort and care of her
loving husband, Jonas. Her strong will, and devotion to her family provided her with the
strength to fight a long, valiant battle with this disease. But now she can rest in the arms
of our Lord and Savior in Heaven.

Jo Carolyn was born to William Joseph Flowers and Carolyn Jeannine Flowers on March
30th, 1969 in Kennett, Mo. That day marked the birth of one of the most strong-willed
and sometimes hard headed person we would ever know. She was a dedicated wife,
mother, and grandmother and always put her family first. Her passion for her career in
long-term care was something one could only hope to have in their line of work. She
worked in every job possible in a nursing home until she reached her ultimate position as
Director of Operations for the entire Southeast MO region. She worked in long-term care
for 32 years up until she departed this life. She was a problem-solver, wonderful boss, and
above all a great co-worker for anyone blessed with the opportunity.

Jo Carolyn was the matriarch of a large and growing family and handled the title better
than anyone could ever imagine. Her family began when she was united in marriage to
her husband, Jonas Bartley Noe, on November 21st, 1990. They were then blessed with 3
children: Mason, Chase, and Hannah. Jo put all her heart into her family and raising her
children, and always pushed them to be the best they could be in every endeavor they took
on. She never missed an event, ballgame, or ceremony they were part of and was always
the loudest in the crowd to cheer on their accomplishments. She was fierce and tenacious
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when it came to her family, but most of all loving. Later in life, she became Grandma
JoJo to grandchildren: Makai, Colben, Madden, and Collins Elizabeth. She was the most
loving and caring grandmother and loved everyone of them exponentially.

Jo Carolyn was the consummate family woman and always willing to help anyone in
need. She would never hesitate to go out of her way to provide for others and always
made everyone feel welcome in her home. She was a mother to 3 of her own, but was like
a second mother to more of her kid’s friends than one could count. She was the best voice
of reason and always had the answers for life’s problems. She will be dearly missed by
many.

She is survived by her husband: Jonas; sons Mason (Taylor), Chase (Caitlyn), and Blaren;
daughter Hannah (Lane); grandchildren, Makai Patrick, Colben Chase, Madden Monroe,
and Collins Elizabeth; brother Bj Flowers; sisters Judi and Kim Flowers. She was
preceded in death by her parents, Bill and Jeannine and her baby sister, Kasi.

Jo Carolyn’s visitation for friends and family will be held February 12th, 2023 from 1:00
p.m. to 4:00 p.m. at Morgan Funeral Home in Advance, Mo. and she will ultimately be
laid to rest on February 13th, 2023 with a funeral service beginning at 11:00 a.m.

Burial will follow at Morgan Memorial Park Cemetery in Advance.

In lieu of flowers, the family requests family and friends to instead donate money to one
of Jo’s favorite philanthropy organizations, St. Jude’s Children Hospital at 501 St. Jude
Place Memphis, TN 38105. She was a consistent donor to this organization and it was
something she was very passionate about.
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