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In Memory of Kyran Link Mitchell

Kyran Link Mitchell, the son of Charles Mitchell of Dexter and Angel Dodson Mitchell of
Essex was born on February 29, 2012 at Poplar Bluff and departed this life on November
14, 2021 at his residence in Dexter at the age of 9.

Kyran was a joy to anyone he met. He was a proud Richland Rebel. Kyran enjoyed
playing video games, building Legos, and watching anime. He loved all things Pokémon
and riding his razor when his health allowed. He wouldn’t let his family out of his sight
and loved being together with them.

In addition to his father, Charles Mitchell and his mother, Angel Mitchell, he is survived
by one sister, Addyson Williamson of Essex; by one brother, Remington Battles of Essex;
by his maternal grandmother, Laura Dodson of Dexter; by his paternal grandfather, David
Mitchell and girlfriend Stephanie Parks of Dudley; by his paternal grandmother, Elizabeth
Sagharichi and husband, Mahmoud of Poplar Bluff and by many close friends and
extended family.

He was preceded in death by his maternal grandfather, Mike Dodson.

Visitation will be conducted on Thursday, November 18, 2021 at the Richland High
School Gymnasium from NOON until 3:00 p.m.

Funeral services will then be conducted on Thursday, November 18, 2021 at 3:00 p.m. in
the Richland High School Gymnasium.

/blog.php?Id=uhb2&PostId=vgev
/blog.php?Id=uhb2&PostId=vgdg
javascript:blogScrollToTop('body')


Interment will follow at the Essex Cemetery.
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In Memory of Noah Joseph Carlisle

Noah Joseph Carlisle of Sikeston, Missouri was born to Joseph Carlisle and Chantelle
Western on November 03, 1999 in Cape Girardeau, Missouri and passed away peacefully
wrapped in his mother's arms on November 13, 2021 at 2:35 p.m. in St. Genevieve,
Missouri at the age of 22 years. 

Noah fought a long and hard battle due to a car accident, however he touched many lives
so he was surrounded with prayers from everywhere.  His family is forever grateful for all
the prayers and support and excellent care during his final days from the nurses at the
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Riverview Nursing Home in St. Genevieve, Missouri.  Chaplain Bob we thank you as
well for riding through this with us and consistent care and support you gave to Noah. 

Noah had been a resident of Sikeston, Missouri most of his life. He worked at Walmart in
Sikeston, Missouri.  He enjoyed helping others, listening to music, spending time with his
family and he loved to play video games.  Noah enjoyed life to the fullest and helping
people see the beauty in how precious life really is.  Noah's daughter Mekenzi Carlisle
was his life.  

Surviving Noah is his daughter Mekenzi Carlisle of Farmington, Missouri, his mother
Chantelle (Larry) Western; his father Joseph Carlisle; six brothers Tanner (Tara) Carlisle
of Sikeston, Missouri, Austin (Felicity) Carlisle of Sikeston, Missouri, Logan Carlisle of
Sikeston, Missouri, John Tyler Carlisle of Sikeston, Missouri, Brandon (Katelin) Western
of Sikeston, Missouri and Trey Western of Sikeston, Missouri; two sisters Bella Carlisle
of Sikeston, Missouri and Caylee Crider of Sikeston, Missouri; two nieces Olivia Carlisle
and Iris Western; two nephews Dawson Western and Liam Carlisle.  Noah is preceded in
death by one sister Macy Carlisle and his maternal grandparents Tamara Crider and Julian
Pease.  A host of family and  friends also survive.   

Visitation will be held on Thursday November 18, 2021 for immediate family from 10:00
a.m. to 11:00 a.m. at Watkins and Sons Funeral Home in Dexter.

Visitation will be held on Thursday November 18, 2021 for public viewing 11:00 a.m. to
1:00 p.m. at Watkins and Sons Funeral Home in Dexter.  

Funeral Services will be held on Thursday November 18, 2021 at 1:00 p.m. with Chaplain
Bob Crecelius of Farmington, Missouri officiating at Watkins and Sons Funeral Home in
Dexter with Watkins and Sons Funeral Service of Dexter in charge of arrangements.
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In Memory of Alice Delores Jarrell

Alice Delores Jarrell, daughter of the late Everett and Ossie Hall, was born on January 20,
1930, in Fisk, Missouri, and departed this life on November 12, 2021, at Cypress Point
Skilled Nursing in Dexter, Missouri, at the age of 91 years.

Mrs. Jarrell was the former co-owner of Jay’s Music Company in Dexter. She attended
the First United Methodist Church in Dexter and was a resident of Dexter. Throughout her
life she enjoyed many activities including water skiing when she was younger, golfing,
bowling, traveling, and gardening. Some of her other hobbies were playing cards and
dominos, quilting, painting, crafting, and cooking.

On October 6, 1947, in Piggott, Arkansas, she was united in marriage to James “Jay”
Jarrell. Mr. Jarrell preceded her in death on November 10, 2015.

She is survived by two sons, Jerry Jarrell and wife Vicky of Dexter and Denny Jarrell and
wife Paula of Dexter; by four grandchildren, Julie Ann Welker and husband Matthew of
Cape Girardeau, Molly Marie Miller and husband Justin of Cape Girardeau, Alison Jean
Braunberger and husband Mark of Springfield, and Jason Paul Jarrell of Springfield; and
by four great-grandchildren, Lucy Lynn Miller, Edwin Jay Miller, Henry James Welker,
and Bode Rex Welker.
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Other than by her parents, she was preceded in death by five brothers, Gary, Brent, Roy,
Charles “Dub”, and Walker; and by three sisters, Marge, Deloma “Toots”, and Sue.

Visitation will be held at Mathis Funeral Home in Dexter on Friday, November 19, 2021,
from 10:00 a.m. until 11:00 a.m.

Funeral services will then be conducted in the Mathis Funeral Home Chapel on Friday,
November 19, 2021, at 11:00 a.m.

Interment will follow in the Dudley Cemetery.

Mathis Funeral Home in Dexter is assisting with arrangements.
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In Memory of John “John John” William Atkinson IV

John “John John” William Atkinson IV was the first baby born in the new year in Cape
Girardeau, Missouri on January 1, 2004. He passed away at his residence in Bernie,
Missouri on November 10, 2021, at the age of 17.

John was a senior at Bernie Senior High School and spent his entire school career there.
He was an honor roll student and a member of SR Beta. He recently spent the summer
working his first job at the Bernie School.

John formerly ran his own YouTube Channel “Comedian Bacon” and he always made his
family laugh. He was an avid Star Wars fan, and loved Marvel movies, having recently
watched the newly released “Eternals” on November 9th, with a group of friends. He
loved Cobra Kai, Stranger Things, and the original show The Wonder Years.

John attended Liberty Hill Church since 2013 and volunteered with running the cameras.
He committed his life to Jesus Christ and was baptized on October 4, 2015. He was
preparing to do the Missouri Special Olympics Polar Plunge, in February. He was a long-
time supporter of the Special Olympics, and this would have been his 10th plunge.

He is survived by his parents, John William Atkinson III and Courtney of Bernie; by his
little brother, Rylan of the home in Bernie; by his big sister, Olivia of Dexter; and by his
big brother, Caleb of Oklahoma. He is also survived by his maternal grandparents, many
aunts and uncles, cousins, friends, and by the family dog, Gemma. John was a light in a
dark world, and the world was a better place with him being in it.

In honor of John, donations may be made to the Missouri Special Olympics Polar Plunge,
c/o the Belly Whoppers and John John Atkinson, 1625 N Kingshighway, Cape Girardeau,
Missouri, 63701.

Visitation will be held at Mathis Funeral Home in Dexter on Monday, November 15,
2021, beginning at 3:30 p.m.

Funeral services will then be conducted on in the Mathis Funeral Home Chapel in Dexter
on Tuesday, November 16, 2021 at 11:00 a.m. Interment will follow in the Bernie
Cemetery.

Mathis Funeral Home in Dexter is assisting with arrangements.
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In Memory of Sandra Kaye Thresher

Sandra Kaye Thresher, daughter of the late Albert “Doc” Morgan and Thelma White
Morgan, was born in East Prairie, Missouri, on March 14, 1945, and departed this life at
her home in East Prairie, Missouri on November 9, 2021, at the age of 74 years.

Mrs. Thresher owned Etc. Shoppe consignment store in East Prairie for many years and
was a member of the First Baptist Church in East Prairie.

She is survived by one son, Duke (Donna) Thresher of East Prairie; one daughter, Shelia
Thresher of East Prairie; four grandchildren, Travis and Shane Irby, Chassey Harper and
Devin Thresher; ten great-grandchildren; four sisters, Frances Watson of Delaware, Ohio,
Mary Hurt Rowe of Wichita, Kansas, Danielle Cummins of Slymar, California and
Pamela (Leo) Goolsby of Advance.
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Sandra was preceded in death by two brothers, William Randolph and Charles Albert
“Buck” Morgan and one sister, Alberta Bishop.

Visitation will be held Saturday, November 13, 2021, at the First Baptist Church in East
Prairie from 10:00 a.m. until time of service at 1:00 p.m. with Bro. George White and
Pastor Dawn Walters officiating. Interment will follow in the Dogwood Cemetery.

Pallbearers will be Duke Thresher, Travis Irby, Shane Irby, Devin Thresher, Wyatt Irby
and T.J. Abernathy.

Mathis Funeral Home in Dexter is assisting with arrangements.
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