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In Memory of Bonnie Sue Canoy

Bonnie Sue Canoy, 48, was born February 23, 1971 in Dexter to Susie Moore of Puxico
and the late James Ray Daniel Canoy of Dexter. She passed away on November 08, 2019
as the result of injuries sustained in a motor vehicle accident in Park Hills, Missouri.

?Bonnie had several hobbies that she enjoyed doing but her favorites included cooking,
crafting, and gardening. She was an amazing cook and baker from her signature fried
chicken to a beautiful wedding cake that left you wanting more. If you ever went to her
house you would have seen all her beautiful plants she grew and tended to on a daily
basis. She could take a plant that had been damaged and was dying and bring it back to
life. She loved animals and would take in every stray animal that she came across. She
was a caring and giving person and it showed in all she did. She was a Sunday School
teacher for several years and had several careers during her lifetime; including, working
as a nursing assistant at the local nursing home. More than anything she loved her family;
especially her boys.

?She is survived by her mother Susie Cross (John) of Puxico; two step-brothers Jon Cross
(Christina) of Dexter and Chris Cross (Pam) of Puxico; half-sister Crystal Canoy of
Dexter; her sons Joshua Rogers (Amanda) of Salem, IN; Christopher Rogers (Shelby) of
Dexter; and Jordon Rogers (Cecelia) of Park Hills; as well as several other family
members and friends. She was preceded in death by her father James Ray Daniel Canoy
in 2006; two brothers, James Daniel Canoy and Daniel Ray Canoy; and an unborn child.
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?Services will be held at Morgan and Sifford Funeral Home in Puxico, Thursday,
November 14, 2019. Visitation will be at noon and the funeral service at 2 pm officiated
by Jerry Canoy with burial services at Fagan Cemetery. She died November 08, 2019 in
Park Hills, Missouri.
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