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Mission Internship is a Great Opportunity for Tyler
Stevenson
MARCH 26TH 2019 BY DEE LOFLIN

Mission Internship is a Great Opportunity for Tyler Stevenson

Tyler Stevenson, 20  graduate of Dexter High School will finish his junior year at Harding
University this spring.

In July he plans to spend six weeks in Lviv, Ukraine as an intern at a young church.

"We are going lead the children while we are there, taking care of the day camps as well
as a couple of summer camps," commented Stevenson.  "Along with these camps we will
be working alongside our host missionaries with ministering to the locals and learning
hands on how to bring the gospel to both non-believers and those who have never heard
the gospel.  We plan to work primarily in the Lviv area, but we also will travel to other
churches across the country."

As a student at Harding University, Tyler, wants to be involved with the mission
internships.  Harding University has been doing internships for almost 30 years now and
as a part of Harding's commitment to be used by God to increase the number of long-term
missionaries in the world.

This trip means a lot to Tyler and he hopes that he not only changes lives while there, but
enhances his own spiritual belief in God.  This trip will change his life forever and it is a
great opportunity for him.
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Tyler has committed to raising $3,500.   As you know, financial participation with Tyler
is actually participation with God in this Kingdom and what He is doing in the life of this
young person.  Your prayers to the Father are also of extreme importance.  If you would
like to help with this mission please contact Tyler at 573-625-8203 or email him at
tstevenson1@harding.edu.  Checks can be made payable to Global Outreach/Harding
University.  All funds raised will go into a restricted account and will only be used to help
pay for the expenses of the summer mission trip.  You can also donate by going online by
CLICKING HERE.

"As our team begins preparations for this missionary internship, I ask that you keep us in
your prayers," continued Stevenson.  "Pray that we will have open and compassionate
hearts to serve God's people in a foreign land.  God is so good at teaching us, and I am
excited to learn what I can from this experience."

Tyler is the son of Kay Stevenson and Keith Stevenson and is a 2016 graduate of Dexter
High School.

While at Dexter he was a member of the Dexter Bearcats Football team all four years of
his high school career.  He also played tennis all four years.

Tyler was a member of Fellowship of Christian Athletes, DECA, Rotary Interact, and
Dexter Honor Society.

He was a 2nd team All-Conference football team selection in 2014 and ESPN SEMO
Gatorade Player of the Week in 2015.  He was also a member of the 2014 Academic All-
State Football Team.

LAST UPDATED ON MARCH 26TH 2019 BY DEE LOFLIN

https://showmetimes.com/Blogpost/vbv2/Mission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson

Go to post

     

mailto:tstevenson1@harding.edu. 
https://public.serviceu.com/DonationForm/21894/?OrgKey=fc33b1f6-dfa3-44ac-b9de-b705e33f6b5c
https://showmetimes.com/Blogpost/vbv2/Mission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson
https://www.facebook.com/sharer/sharer.php?u=https%3A%2F%2Fshowmetimes.com%2FBlogpost%2Fvbv2%2FMission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson
https://twitter.com/intent/tweet?url=https%3A%2F%2Fshowmetimes.com%2FBlogpost%2Fvbv2%2FMission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson&text=Mission+Internship+is+a+Great+Opportunity+for+Tyler+Stevenson
https://www.linkedin.com/cws/share?url=https%3A%2F%2Fshowmetimes.com%2FBlogpost%2Fvbv2%2FMission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson
mailto:subject=Mission Internship is a Great Opportunity for Tyler Stevenson&body=https://showmetimes.com/Blogpost/vbv2/Mission-Internship-is-a-Great-Opportunity-for-Tyler-Stevenson
/blog.php?&PostId=vbv2&Single=1&Pdf=1


More from ShowMe Times:

Previous 5Get Next 5

 SUBSCRIBE TO "FEATURES"

ShowMe Gold Sponsors

/blog.php?Id=uhif&PostId=vcf4
/blog.php?Id=uhif&PostId=vcbv
/blog_rss.php?Id=uhif

