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Hayti Indians Come Out Strong in First Game of the
2018 Bloomfield Christmas Tournament
DECEMBER 26TH 2018 BY DEE LOFLIN

Hayti Indians Come Out Strong in First Game of the 2018 Bloomfield Christmas Tournament

Bloomfield, Missouri - The #1 seeded Hayti Indians went on the attack in the first game
of the 2018 Bloomfield Christmas Tournament on Wednesday, December 26, 2018.

The Indians scored the first 18 points against the Holcomb Hornets.

The Hornets scored their first bucket at the 3:45 minutes mark in the first period.

At the end of the first quarter Hayti 35, Holcomb 9.

Hayti continued to hold the lead throughout the first half.   The Indians held them to just
22 points in the first periods while their offense scored 69 points just before going into the
locker room at half-time.

It was a long game for the Hornets.  Hayti score a total of 35 points in the 3rd period to
boost their lead to 76.

Xavier Jammerson led the Indians with a game-high 30 points.  He had 14 buckets and
was 2/5 in field goals.

Ivory Winters recorded 15 points on 7 buckets and a field goal followed by Damori Reed
with 14 and Tyliek Moore with 14.  TreCharles McCoy also was in double digits finishing
with 13.
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Two Hornets finished in double figures.  Nate Rhew had a team-high 14 points on 4 treys
and one two-pointers.  Eli Bader recorded 10 points.  He was 4 for 4 from the charity
stripe and hit three buckets.

Hayti's defense held the Hornets to single digits in each of the four periods.

Final Score  Hayti 115, Holcomb 40

Hayti        35   34   35   11  -  115

Holcomb    8    6      9     6  -   40

Hayti (115)  Ivory Winters 15, Jarrod Covington 2, Travon Thomas 2, Chrivonte Moore
6, Damori Reed 14, Nakwon Harris 2, TreCharles McCoy 13, Cordell Jones 7, Tyliek
Moore 14, Xavier Jammerson 30, Trivante Stephenson 8, and Jaydan Wilbourn 2.  FG 51,
FT 12/25, Fouls 16. (3-pointers: Tyliek Moore 1, Fouled Out: None)

Holcomb (40) - Topher Kendrick 2, Elijiah Hobbs 5, Ben Maynard 2, Eli Bader 10, Nate
Rhew 14, Logan Williamson 5, Greg Kendrilk 2. FG 14, FT 6/9, F 18 (3-pointers: Hobbs
1, Rhew 4, Williamson 1.  Fouled Out: None)

Hayti will play the winner of the Portageville vs Van Buren game that will be played at 8
p.m. Wednesday, December 26th.  Game 13 will be played at 4 p.m. on Thursday,
December 27th.

Holcomb will play the loser of the Portageville vs Van Buren game.  Game 12 will be
played at 2:30 p.m. on Thursday, December 27th at the 2018 Bloomfield Christmas
Tournament.
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