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Mules Shut Out Eagles
SEPTEMBER 27TH 2016 BY DEE LOFLIN

Mules Shut Out Eagles

Naylor, Missouri - The Bernie Mules baseball team traveled to Naylor on Friday,
September 16th capturing a 15-0 victory over the Eagles.

The Mules jumped out to an early lead with 10 runs in the first three innings. They left no
doubt about the eventual outcome.

Josh Ellenburg had two extra-base hits for Bernie Mules Varsity. He doubled in the third
inning, tripled in the fourth inning, and singled in the second and fifth innings.

Blake Beacham kept Naylor off the scoreboard for all five innings he was on the mound.
He pitched a shutout, allowing only  three hits while ringing up four.

Bernie tacked on another seven runs in the third. A hit into a fielder's choice to start the
scoring in the inning. That was followed up by Josh Ellenburg's double, plating Hunter
Slavings and Alex Guzman.

The Mules built upon its lead with three runs in the fourth. A triple by Nate Dillinger
ignited the offense, bringing home Josh Ellenburg.

Bernie piled on two more runs in the top of the fifth, scoring Josh Ellenburg for the
inning's first run. That was followed up by Hobgood's single, scoring Dillinger.

Photo taken at a previous Bernie Mules Baseball Game.
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Mules Beat Leopold in Fall Baseball
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Mules Beat Leopold in Fall Baseball

Bernie, Missouri - A magnificent effort by Corbin Hunt spurred the Bernie Mules varsity
baseball team to a 4-1 win in seven innings over Leopold on Monday, September 19th at
Bernie.

The Mules got the win thanks in large part to Hunt's dominant, eight-strikeout
performance. Hunt allowed one earned run on two hits and one walk over seven innings.

Mike Suiter pushed Bernie Mules Varsity ahead, in the sixth inning, and the lead lasted
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until the final out. Alex Guzman singled to get on base in the sixth.

Jayce Burk went a perfect 3-3 at the dish for Bernie Mules Varsity. He doubled in the
fifth inning and singled in the third and sixth innings.

Leopold 's lone run of the ballgame came in the first inning on an RBI single by Blake
Leazenby.

Final Score Bernie 4, Leopold 1

Leopold 100 000 0 - 1 2 3

Bernie  001 003 x - 4 9 1

WP -- Corbin Hunt. LP -- Tristan Graham. 2B -- Jayce Burk (B). Multiple hits -- Bernie:
Burk 3-3, Weston Comstock 2-3.
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JV Bulldogs Beat Bearcats

Sikeston, Missouri - Bulldogs' junior varsity quarterback Gage Rolwing tossed two
touchdown passes and ran for another during Sikeston's home win over the Dexter
Bearcats 20 - 6.

Rolwing threw the ball in the first quarter finding B.J. Hill for a 66-yard touchdown.

Later Rolwing found Hayden Alcorn from 25 yards out and followed it with a 2-point
pass to Trent Elliot for a 14-0 lead at the half.

After the Bearcats scored in the third quarter, Rolwing ran for a 5-yard score in the fourth
to make up the final points of the game.
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MDC Encourages Deer Hunters to Share the Harvest

Share the Harvest provides venison from hunters to help feed hungry Missourians.

Jefferson City, Missouri - The Missouri Department of Conservation (MDC) encourages
deer hunters around the state to share their harvest through the state’s Share the Harvest
program. Administered by MDC and the Conservation Federation of Missouri (CFM),
Share the Harvest coordinates the efforts of thousands of deer hunters, about 100
participating meat processors, numerous local supporting organizations, and a handful of
statewide sponsors.

The program works by deer hunters donating their extra venison -- from several pounds to
whole deer -- to participating meat processors throughout the state who grind and package
the deer meat. The packaged venison is then given to food banks and food pantries for
distribution to Missourians in need of food assistance.

Processing fees are covered entirely or in part by numerous local sponsors, along with
statewide sponsors that include: MDC, CFM, Shelter Insurance, Bass Pro Shops, Gateway
Area Chapter of Safari Club International, Missouri Chapter of the National Wild Turkey
Federation, Midway USA Inc., and the Missouri Food Banks Association.

Funds are available to help with processing costs when a whole deer is donated during all
portions of the archery and firearms deer seasons. The Conservation Federation of
Missouri reimburses processors a pre-determined amount for each whole deer donated.
This allows processors to reduce processing fees to hunters. In addition, many processors
have local funds available that allow deer to be processed for free or at a reduced cost.
Hunters should contact individual processors to determine what funds are available. The
cost of processing is the hunter’s responsibility when funds to help cover the full cost are
not available.

More than 4,500 deer hunters donated more than a quarter-million pounds of venison
from last season's deer harvest. Since the program was started in 1992, Share the Harvest
has provided more than 3.5 million pounds of lean, healthy venison to help feed hungry
Missourians.
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Mules Baseball Team Takes Out South Pemiscot

Bernie, Missouri - The Mules varsity baseball team beat South Pemiscot 6-2 in seven
innings on Tuesday, September 20th.

Alex Guzman's six strikeouts helped Bernie Mules Varsity to the victory. Guzman
allowed two earned runs, five hits and two walks over seven innings.

The Mules scored two runs in the first inning to jump out with the early 2-0 lead.

One run in the top of the second helped South Pemiscot close its deficit to 2-1. An RBI
double by Russell sparked South Pemiscot 's rally. Willingham flew out to end the South
Pemiscot threat.
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It didn't take long for Bernie Mules Varsity to answer as it scored one run of its own in the
second and third inning to make it a 4-1 game. 

Bernie added two more runs in the bottom of the fifth. A clutch error scored Hobgood to
open the scoring in the frame. That was followed up by Nate Dillinger's single, plating
Guzman. To make it a 6-1 game in the fifth.

South Pemiscot faced just a 6-1 deficit going into the 7th. A solo home run by McCulloch
gave South Pemiscot life. Finally, Guzman got Willingham to to end the game. For score
of 6-2 final.
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