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Bearcats Fall to Mules in SCAA

Written by
Jessica Snider SMT Writer

It was a much-anticipated match up last night as the Dexter Bearcats and the Bernie
Mules traveled to Bell City for their 8:00 P.M. match up against each other.

Earlier in the season, the Bearcats played a very tense game against the Mules and pulled
out ahead but using three sets to do so.

Last night during the Stoddard County Tournament it was a different story though. It
seemed as though Bernie could do no wrong when they stepped onto the court for the
competition. The Mules had spot-on serves and kills that were unstoppable.

During the first set, the score rallied back and forth between the two evenly talented teams
until Bernie took off at the end with a 19-25 victory over the Bearcats.

Most Bearcat fans expected to see a great turn around during the second set as everyone
hoped Coach Morgan could fire her team up enough to send them to victory. The team
was fired up throughout the second set and they came out stronger than they had in the
first. It just wasn’t enough to withstand Bernie’s offense though.

Throughout the first and second sets, Dexter fell short on a lot of their serves; giving
Bernie a free point. That’s not to say that it wasn’t a nail biting game to sit through
though. As the two teams battled back and forth the whole second set, Bernie eventually
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took the win with a 23-25 victory over the Bearcats as they defeated them in just two sets.

It was a great game to be watched by fans of both teams as they all played with their
hearts. The two teams are always evenly matched which makes for good volleyball
watching year after year.

The Stoddard County Volleyball Tournament will continue tonight in Bell City.
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The Bearcat on the Fence

If you haven't passed by Charles "Seed" Bland Stadium lately you definitely need to make
sure you come out to the game for Senior night.  One of the projects that the Dexter High
School Student Council did for Homecoming is worth seeing.
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For the project of the fence decorations in the past many people have used red Solo cups
stuck in the chain link fence to create a design.  This year Student Council decided to do
something a little different.

The Student council advisor, Jennifer Miller, and the Student Council looked for some
things that would stand out and look nice for homecoming weekend.  They found a
product from The Prom Nite Company.  It is small, reusable, plastic inserts that fit into
the diamond shaped gaps in the chain-link fencing around the football stadium.

"The company sent us a small picture of how they were supposed to be installed."  Miller
recalled.  "It was very time consuming and difficult to complete, but the results turned out
awesome.

Student council members; Honey Patel, Rebecca Singh, and Kasity Twaddell completed
the design.  These students had to transfer the design from a small picture that was sent to
the Prom Nite Company onto the fence by counting each space on that area of the fence.

This project turned out great and really looks awesome. It is something that will catch the
eye of the fans and intimidate the opposing teams as they enter the stadium.

Be sure to come check out the great job that these students did on this awesome piece that
helps to dress up Charles "Seed" Bland Stadium for Senior Night at tonight's game.
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DHS School Activities Oct. 15-19

Dexter High School- This listing of activities is a service offered by the ShowMe Times,
working in partnership with the Dexter Public Schools for you convenience.

The ShowMe Times would like to encourage all of our readers to support our local school
system. The education and growth of the young people in our community is important to
everyone's future.

We would like everyone to join us as we encourage these young people in their pursuits. 
So lets get involved by supporting the events at our schools.
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TS Hill Middle School Activities Oct 15-20

Dexter  T. S. Hill Middle School - This schedule is offered as a service of the ShowMe
Times, working in conjunction with the Dexter Public Schools for your convenience. 

The ShowMe Times encourages all of our readers to become involved in our local school
system. 

As an important part of our community, the support of the education process of our young
people remains the very fabric of our future.  Get involved by supporting the events at our
schools.
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DHS Students Chosen for All-District Choir

Recently several students from the surrounding district traveled to Cape Central High
School in Cape Girardeau to audition for the Southeast All-District Choir.  Out of all of
the students that made the trip to Cape Girardeau on September 22nd, only a select few
are chosen for this honor.

These students chosen for the All-District Choir the students will travel to Jackson High
School and perform a concert on evening of November 10th. Along with all of the other
students chosen for the All-District Choir, the students chosen from Dexter will only have
the day of the concert to rehearse.

The All-District Choir is divided into two groups, one consists of 11th and 12th grade
students and the other is 9th and 10th grade students.

The 11th and 12th grade students who made the All-District Choir are Riley Rickman,
Emily Long, Ashley Long, and the alternate is Reale Cook.

The students selected for the 9th and 10th grade division are; Shelby Gathings, Brooks
Propst, Shayna Bess, Jacob Murdock, Lauren Thrower, Justin Godwin, Jon Rogers,
Jordan Dodson, Jacob Palmer, and the alternates being Brandon Quertermous and Zach
Price.
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The choir program at Dexter High School does a great job with these students and has a
couple of events coming up that are sure to be a hits.  The Honors Choir is traveling to
Poplar Bluff on October 16th to participate in the Fall Choral Festival at the Tinnin Fine
Arts Center on the campus of Three Rivers College.  The concert begins at 7:00 P.M. and
everyone is welcome and encouraged to come see the areas top choirs. 

The choir will be performing a musical, "You're a Good Man Charlie Brown," on
November 14th-16th, with tickets going on sale the first week of November for $10
apiece.  Be sure to make plans to come out and support these talented Dexter students.
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