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Heat Advisory Issued for Stoddard County Until Sunday

The National Weather Service in Paducah, Kentucky has issued a Heat Advisory until 8
p.m. Sunday, July 24, 2022.  

Affected Area

Southeast Missouri and portions of western Kentucky and southern Illinois, to the west of
a Wickliffe Kentucky to Mt Vernon Illinois line

Description

...HEAT ADVISORY REMAINS IN EFFECT UNTIL 8 PM CDT SUNDAY...

WHAT...Heat index values 105 to 110 each afternoon.

WHERE...Southeast Missouri and portions of western Kentucky and southern Illinois, to
the west of a Wickliffe Kentucky to Mt Vernon Illinois line.

WHEN...Until 8 PM CDT Sunday.

IMPACTS...Hot temperatures and high humidity may cause heat illnesses to occur.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...

Drink plenty of fluids, stay in an air-conditioned room, stay out of the sun, and check up
on relatives and neighbors. Young children and pets should never be left unattended in
vehicles under any circumstances.

Take extra precautions if you work or spend time outside. When possible reschedule
strenuous activities to early morning or evening. Know the signs and symptoms of heat
exhaustion and heat stroke. Wear lightweight and loose fitting clothing when possible. To
reduce risk during outdoor work, the Occupational Safety and Health Administration
recommends scheduling frequent rest breaks in shaded or air conditioned environments.
Anyone overcome by heat should be moved to a cool and shaded location. Heat stroke is
an emergency! Call 9 1 1.

Weather provided by Bagby Wealth Management.
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Heat Advisory Issued for Stoddard County for Tuesday

Stoddard County, MO - The National Weather Service in Paducah, KY has issued a Heat
Advisory for Stoddard County for Tuesday, July 19, 2022.

Affected Area

Portions of southeast Missouri, far west Kentucky and far southwest Illinois

Description

...HEAT ADVISORY IN EFFECT FROM 1 PM TO 8 PM CDT TUESDAY...

WHAT...Heat index values up to 106 expected.

WHERE...Portions of southeast Missouri, far west Kentucky and far southwest Illinois.

WHEN...From 1 PM to 8 PM CDT Tuesday.

IMPACTS...Hot temperatures and high humidity may cause heat illnesses to occur.
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ADDITIONAL DETAILS...The Heat Advisory includes the following counties in
southeast Missouri: Bollinger, Butler, Cape Girardeau, Carter, Mississippi, New Madrid,
Ripley, Scott, Stoddard, and Wayne. In southwest Illinois: Alexander, Pulaski, and Union.
In west Kentucky: Ballard, Carlisle, Fulton, and Hickman.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...

Drink plenty of fluids, stay in an air-conditioned room, stay out of the sun, and check up
on relatives and neighbors. Young children and pets should never be left unattended in
vehicles under any circumstances.

Take extra precautions if you work or spend time outside. When possible reschedule
strenuous activities to early morning or evening. Know the signs and symptoms of heat
exhaustion and heat stroke. Wear lightweight and loose fitting clothing when possible. To
reduce risk during outdoor work, the Occupational Safety and Health Administration
recommends scheduling frequent rest breaks in shaded or air conditioned environments.
Anyone overcome by heat should be moved to a cool and shaded location. Heat stroke is
an emergency! Call 9 1 1.
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Severe Thunderstorm Warning Issued until 8:45 p.m.

Stoddard County, MO - The National Weather Service in Paducah, Kentucky has issued a
Severe Thunderstorm WARNING for Stoddard County, MO

Description

The National Weather Service in Paducah has issued a

Severe Thunderstorm Warning for... Bollinger County in southeastern Missouri...
Southern Perry County in southeastern Missouri... Eastern Wayne County in southeastern
Missouri... Northwestern Stoddard County in southeastern Missouri... Western Cape
Girardeau County in southeastern Missouri...

Until 845 PM CDT.

At 759 PM CDT, severe thunderstorms were located along a line extending from 6 miles
northeast of Alliance to near Buckhorn to near Cascade to near Greenville, moving east at
25 mph.

HAZARD...60 mph wind gusts and penny size hail.

SOURCE...Radar indicated.

IMPACT...Expect damage to roofs, siding, and trees.

Severe thunderstorms will be near... Alliance around 805 PM CDT.

Other locations in the path of these severe thunderstorms include Grassy, Daisy, Marble
Hill, Patton, Altenburg and Leopold.

This includes Interstate 55 between Mile Markers 106 and 123.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...
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For your protection move to an interior room on the lowest floor of a building.

To report severe weather, contact your nearest law enforcement agency. They will send
your report to the National Weather Service office in Paducah.

Large hail and damaging winds and continuous cloud to ground lightning is occurring
with these storms. Move indoors immediately. Lightning is one of nature's leading killers.
Remember, if you can hear thunder, you are close enough to be struck by lightning.

Torrential rainfall is occurring with these storms, and may lead to flash flooding. Do not
drive your vehicle through flooded roadways.

HAIL THREAT...RADAR INDICATED; MAX HAIL SIZE...0.75 IN; WIND
THREAT...RADAR INDICATED; MAX WIND GUST...60 MPH
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Excessive Heat Warning Continues Until 7 p.m. Friday Evening

Stoddard County, MO - An Excessive Heat Warning remains in effect until 7 p.m. Friday,
July 8, 2022.  Please check on neighbors without air conditioning and animals that are
kept outside.

Affected Area

Southeast Missouri, most of western Kentucky, and most of southern Illinois south of the
Interstate 64 corridor

Description

...EXCESSIVE HEAT WARNING NOW IN EFFECT UNTIL 7 PM CDT FRIDAY...

WHAT...Dangerously hot conditions with heat index values up to 112.

WHERE...Southeast Missouri, most of western Kentucky, and most of southern Illinois
south of the Interstate 64 corridor.

WHEN...Until 7 PM CDT Friday evening.

IMPACTS...Extreme heat and humidity will significantly increase the potential for heat
related illnesses, particularly for those working or participating in outdoor activities.

ADDITIONAL DETAILS...Scattered thunderstorm activity could bring localized relief
again Friday afternoon.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...

Drink plenty of fluids, stay in an air-conditioned room, stay out of the sun, and check up
on relatives and neighbors. Young children and pets should never be left unattended in
vehicles under any circumstances.

Weather provided by Bagby Wealth Management.
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Heat Advisory for Stoddard County Until Thursday, July 7, 2022

Stoddard County, MO - The National Weather Service in Paducah, Kentucky has issued a
HEAT ADVISORY from Monday, July 4th - Thursday, July 7, 2022 for Stoddard
County, MO.

Affected Area

Portions of southwest Indiana, southeast Missouri, western Kentucky, and southern
Illinois

Description

...HEAT ADVISORY IN EFFECT FROM 11 AM MONDAY TO 1 PM CDT
THURSDAY...

WHAT...Heat index values up to 109 expected.

WHERE...Portions of southwest Indiana, southeast Missouri, western Kentucky, and
southern Illinois.

WHEN...From 11 AM Monday through Thursday afternoon.
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IMPACTS...Hot temperatures and high humidity may cause heat illnesses to occur.

ADDITIONAL DETAILS...Daily chances for isolated thunderstorms will provide brief
relief from the heat.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...

Drink plenty of fluids, stay in an air-conditioned room, stay out of the sun, and check up
on relatives and neighbors. Young children and pets should never be left unattended in
vehicles under any circumstances.

Take extra precautions if you work or spend time outside. When possible reschedule
strenuous activities to early morning or evening. Know the signs and symptoms of heat
exhaustion and heat stroke. Wear lightweight and loose fitting clothing when possible. To
reduce risk during outdoor work, the Occupational Safety and Health Administration
recommends scheduling frequent rest breaks in shaded or air conditioned environments.
Anyone overcome by heat should be moved to a cool and shaded location. Heat stroke is
an emergency! Call 9 1 1.
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Special Weather Statement Issued for Stoddard County, MO

National Weather Service in Paducah, Kentucky has issued a Special Weather Statement
for Wednesday, June 22, 2022.

Description

...Peak Heat Index Values of 100 to 105 Degrees Today...

Humidity levels will be noticeably higher today versus the past few days. This humidity,
combined with temperatures in the middle to upper 90s, will result in peak heat index
values of 100 to 105 degrees across the region late this morning into this afternoon.
Isolated to widely scattered thunderstorm development during the afternoon will provide
limited relief from the heat.

Those with outdoor activities planned this afternoon should consider rescheduling them to
the cooler early morning or evening hours. If you must be outdoors in the heat, drink
plenty of water and take frequent breaks in an air conditioned environment.
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Excessive Heat Warning Downgraded to Heat Advisory

Stoddard County, MO - The National Weather Service in Paducah, KY has downgraded
the Excessive Heat Warning to a HEAT ADVISORY from 8 p.m. Thursday until 8 p.m.
Friday.

Affected Area

Portions of southeast Missouri, far western Kentucky and far southwest Illinois

Description

...HEAT ADVISORY IN EFFECT UNTIL 8 PM CDT FRIDAY... ...EXCESSIVE HEAT
WARNING WILL EXPIRE AT 8 PM CDT THIS EVENING...

WHAT...Heat index values of 100 to 105 degrees expected Friday afternoon.

WHERE...Portions of southeast Missouri, far western Kentucky and far southwest
Illinois.

WHEN...Until 8 PM CDT Friday.

IMPACTS...Hot temperatures and high humidity may cause heat illnesses to occur.
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ADDITIONAL DETAILS...Isolated to scattered thunderstorms may bring pockets of
relief from the heat.

PRECAUTIONARY/PREPAREDNESS ACTIONS...

Drink plenty of fluids, stay in an air-conditioned room, stay out of the sun, and check up
on relatives and neighbors. Young children and pets should never be left unattended in
vehicles under any circumstances.

Take extra precautions if you work or spend time outside. When possible reschedule
strenuous activities to early morning or evening. Know the signs and symptoms of heat
exhaustion and heat stroke. Wear lightweight and loose fitting clothing when possible. To
reduce risk during outdoor work, the Occupational Safety and Health Administration
recommends scheduling frequent rest breaks in shaded or air conditioned environments.
Anyone overcome by heat should be moved to a cool and shaded location. Heat stroke is
an emergency! Call 9 1 1.
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